
DEFENCE FORCE REMUNERATION TRIBUNAL 
 

DETERMINATION NO. 19 OF 1999  
 

SALARIES OF SENIOR OFFICERS 
 
 

The Defence Force Remuneration Tribunal makes the following Determination under section 
58H of the Defence Act 1903: 
 
 

PART A - Preliminary 
 
Commencement 
 

1. This Determination is to be taken to have commenced on 11 November 1999. 
 
 

PART B – Amendment of Determination No. 6 of 1992 
 
Amendment 
 

2. Determination No. 6 of 1992, Salaries, as amended, is amended as set out in this 
Determination. 

 
Schedule 2 (Scale of Annual Rates – Officer of the Permanent Forces) 

 
3. Omit the items for the officer ranks mentioned in Attachment A, substitute the 

corresponding items mentioned in Attachment A. 
 
Schedule 4 (Scale of Annual Rates – Medical and Dental Officer of the Permanent Forces) 
 

4. Omit the items for the officer ranks mentioned in Attachment B, substitute the 
corresponding items mentioned in Attachment B. 

 
Schedule 5 (Scale of Annual Rates – Chaplain of the Permanent Forces) 
 

5. Omit the items for an officer mentioned in Attachment C, substitute the corresponding 
items mentioned in Attachment C. 

 
Schedule 9 (Scale of Daily Rates – Officer of the Reserve Forces) 
 

6. Omit the items for the officer ranks mentioned in Attachment D, substitute the 
corresponding items mentioned in Attachment D. 

 
Schedule 10 (Scale of Daily Rates – Medical and Dental Officer of the Reserve Forces) 
 

7. Omit the items for the officer ranks mentioned in Attachment E, substitute the 
corresponding items mentioned in Attachment E. 

 
 
 



Schedule 11 (Scale of Daily Rates – Chaplain of the Reserve Forces) 
 

8. Omit the items for an officer mentioned in Attachment F, substitute the corresponding 
items mentioned in Attachment F 

 
Schedule 12 (Scale of Annual Rates Specific Appointments – Reserve Forces) 
 

9. Omit the item relating to the Assistant Chief of Army – Army Reserve. 
 
10. Omit the items for an officer mentioned in Attachment G, substitute the corresponding 

items mentioned in Attachment G. 
 

11. Omit “Consultant Colonel (Medical), Active Australian Army Reserve, 2nd Military 
District”, substitute “Colonel (Medical), Director Health Services, Army Reserve, 
Eastern Region”. 

 
12. Omit “Consultant Colonel (Medical), Active Australian Army Reserve, 3rd Military 

District”, substitute “Colonel (Medical), Director Health Services, Army Reserve, 
Southern Region”. 

 
PART C – Amendment of Determination No.7 of 1997 

 
Amendment 
 

13. Determination No.7 of 1997, Flying Allowance, as amended, is amended as set out in this 
Determination. 

 
Clause 7 (Flying Allowance [Qualification and Skill]) 
 

14. Paragraph 7.1 (c): 
Omit “$15,653”, substitute “$16,123”. 

 
Clause 8 (Flying Allowance [Disability]) 
 

15. Paragraph 8.1 (d): 
Omit “$4,085”, substitute “$4,208”. 

 
 
 
Dated this seventeenth day of December nineteen hundred and ninety nine. 
 
 
The Hon. Justice A J Boulton 
President      ........................................... 
 
 
Commissioner P L Leary 
Member      ........................................... 
 
 
Air Vice Marshal F D Cox, AO (Retd) 
Member      ........................................... 



Attachment A 
 
 
AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 2 (SCALE OF ANNUAL RATES 

– OFFICER OF THE PERMANENT FORCES) 
 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 
 
Navy Army Air Force Rate of Salary 

$ a year 
  
Commodore Brigadier Air Commodore $96972 
 
Rear Admiral Major General Air Vice Marshal $117327 

 



Attachment B 
 
AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 4 (SCALE OF ANNUAL RATES 

– MEDICAL AND DENTAL OFFICER OF THE PERMANENT 
FORCES) 

 
Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 
 
Navy Army Air Force Rate of Salary 

$ a year 
  
Commodore Brigadier Air Commodore $112376 
 
Rear Admiral Major General Air Vice Marshal $117327 

 



Attachment C 
 
AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 5 (SCALE OF ANNUAL RATES 

– CHAPLAIN OF THE PERMANENT FORCES) 
 
 
Column 1 Column 2 
 
Classification Salary 
 $ a year 
 
Chaplain Division 5 86634 
  



Attachment D 
 
AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 9 (SCALE OF DAILY RATES – 

OFFICER OF THE RESERVE FORCES) 
 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 
 
Navy Army Air Force Rate of Salary 

$ a day 
  
Commodore Brigadier Air Commodore $225.83 
 
Rear Admiral Major General Air Vice Marshal $273.23 

 



Attachment E 
 

AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 10 (SCALE OF DAILY RATES 
– MEDICAL AND DENTAL OFFICER OF THE RESERVE 

FORCES) 
 

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 
 
Navy Army Air Force Rate of Salary 

$ a day 
  
Commodore Brigadier Air Commodore $261.70 
 
Rear Admiral Major General Air Vice Marshal $273.23 

 



Attachment F 
 

AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 11 (SCALE OF DAILY RATES 
– CHAPLAIN OF THE RESERVE FORCES) 

 
Column 1 Column 2 
  
Classification Salary 
 $ a day 
  
  
Chaplain Division 5 201.75 
  



Attachment G 
 

AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULE 12 (SCALE OF ANNUAL 
RATES SPECIFIC APPOINTMENTS – RESERVE FORCES) 

 
Column 1 Column 2 
 
Appointment Rate per year $ 
 
 
Assistant Chief of the Defence Force (Reserves) $30266 
 
Appointment in the establishment of the Army, for which the rank 
of Major General is provided in that establishment 

$29332 

 
Appointment, other than a medical appointment, in the 
establishment of the Army, for which the rank of Brigadier is 
provided in that establishment 

$24243 

 
Appointment in the establishment of the Army, being a medical 
appointment, for which the rank of Brigadier is provided in that 
establishment 

$28094 

 
 


	DEFENCE FORCE REMUNERATION TRIBUNAL

