DEFENCE FORCE REMUNERATION TRIBUNAL
DETERMINATION NO. 10 OF 2011

SALARIES — SENIOR OFFICERS — AMENDMENT

The Defence Force Remuneration Tribunal makes the following Determination under
section 58H of the Defence Act 1903.

Commencement
1. This Determination commences on the date of signature.
Amendment '

2.1 Determination No. 15 of 2008, Salaries, as amended, is amended as set out in clauses
3 and 4 of this Determination.

2.2 Determination No. 7 of 2010, Salary of Chief Joint Operations, is amended as set out
in clauses 5, 6, 7 and 8 of this Determination.

2.3 Determination No. 8 of 2010, Salary of Chief Capability Development Group, is
amended as set out in clauses 9, 10, 11 and 12 of this Determination.

DETERMINATION NO. 15 OF 2008, SALARIES

Paft 2 of Schedule B.1 (Senior Officer of the Reserve Force), item for increment 010-0
3.1 Omit “$1,006.44”

3.2  Insert “$1,079.18” .

Part 2 of Schedule B.1 (Senior Officer of the Reserve Force), item for increment 09-0
4.1 Omit “$684.36”

42  Insert “$733.84”

DETERMINATION NO. 7 OF 2010, SALARY OF CHIEF JOINT OPERATIONS
Subclause 3.2 (Remuneration package for Chief Joint Operatlons)

5.1 Omit “$369,780”

52  Insert “$380,880”

Subclause 3.3 (Remuneration package for Chief Joint Operations)

6.1 Omit “$260,040”

6.2  Insert “$267,850”

Paragraph 4.3(b) (Payment of the remuneration package)

7.1 Omit “$130,020”

7.2  Insert “$133,925”

Clause 5 (Transitional)

8. Substitute:

“5. A member may continue to be paid under this Determination for any period of leave
taken on ceasing to hold the position, prior to resignation or transfer to the Reserves.”



DETERMINATION NO. 8 OF 2010, SALARY OF CHIEF CAPABILITY
DEVELOPMENT GROUP '

Subclause 3.2 (Remuneration package for Chief Capability Development Group)
9.1 Omit “$369,780”

9.2  Insert “$380,880”

Subclause 3.3 (Remuneration package for Chief Capability Development Group)
10.1  Omit “$260,040”

102 Insert “$267,850”

Paragraph 4.3(b) (Payment of the remuneration package)

11.1  Omit “$130,020”

112 Insert “$133,925”

Clause 5 (Transitional)

12.  Substitute:

“5. A member may continue to be paid under this Determination for any period of leave
taken on ceasing to hold the position, prior to resignation or transfer to the Reserves.”

Dated this twenty-third day of November two thousand and eleven.

The Honourable P L Leary
President

The Honourable A. Bevis
Member

Brigadier W. D. Rolfe, AO, (Ret’d)
Member



